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T H E  tiansformaat ion of solar 
energy into potential food energy 
by photosynrhes!~ is the most im- 
portant single factor governing the 
productivity of any region in the 
sea. This food energy is trans- 
ferred through a series of consu- 
mers and ultimately is made avail- 
able as fish. In the operation of 
this system four steps can be re- 
cognised: i. c , reception of light 
energy, production of organic 
material by phytoplankton utilis- 
in& inorganic nutrients, consump- 
tion of organic material by con- 
sumers and decomposition of the 
oraanic material to irlorganic 
nutrients. So taking all seas as a 
whole it may be mentioned that 
the replenishment of  n~t r ien ts  in 
the productive layers is the most 
important aspect governing the 

'magnitude of the annual organic 
production. Nature has establi- 
shed an equilibrium between all 
factors influencing production. 
Any change in one of the factors 
will normally influence the other 
factors as well and establish a new 
equilibrium. Besides the repleni- 
shment of nutrients. light, tem- 
perature and grazing by zoopl- 
ankton are the other important 
factors that determine the magni- 
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